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Improved public order and reduction in public injecting and associated discarded 
injecting equipment  

Evidence from the Sydney MSIC and internationally has shown that the establishment of a 
SIF improves negative impacts upon public order as a result of IDU presence. Evaluation of 
the Vancouver SIF showed a 50% reduction in both public injecting and the presence of 
publically discarded syringes (Wood et al., 2004). Similarly, evaluation of the Sydney MSIC 
noted a 28% reduction in discarded syringes and a significant decline in self-reported public 
injecting (MSIC Evaluation Committee, 2003).  
 

Referrals to drug treatment 

Drug treatment, particularly opioid substitution therapy, is effective in reducing injecting 
frequency and injecting related harms such as overdoses and blood borne viruses (Amato et 
al., 2005; Booth et al., 2011).  Evaluations of both the Vancouver SIF and the Sydney MSIC 
showed evidence of effective referrals into treatment. In just 12 months of operation, the 
Vancouver SIF made 2171 referrals for 4764 individual clients (Tyndall et al., 2006), and 
evaluation of the Sydney MSIC found that MSIC clients were more likely than other groups 
of people who inject drugs (PWID) to report initiation of treatment for drug dependence 
(MSIC Evaluation Committee, 2003). Additionally, MSIC clients reported safer injecting 
practices and decreased injecting-related harms (such as skin infections) since registering 
with the MSIC (MSIC Evaluation Committee, 2003). 

Minimal ‘honey-pot’ effects  

Clear evidence of any ‘honey-pot’ effects, whereby PWID may be attracted to areas where 
SIFs operate has not been found. Evaluators of the Vancouver SIF examined official recorded 
crime rates as markers for a ‘honey-pot’ effect and noted no significant increases in drug 
trafficking or assaults and robberies in the year following opening of the SIF (Wood, Tyndall, 
Lai, Montaner, & Kerr, 2006). Instead, they noted a decline in vehicle break-ins/thefts. 
Similarly, evaluators of the Sydney MSIC noted no increases in the number of thefts and 
robbery incidents in Kings Cross, or significant increases in drug-related loitering following 
the opening of the facility (MSIC Evaluation Committee, 2003). Importantly, reports on drug 
related activity in interviews with key informants and police focus groups were consistent 
with the overall evaluation finding that the SIF did not increase drug-related activity (MSIC 
Evaluation Committee, 2003).  
 

Increased public support for SIF operations 
 

Local public support for the Sydney MSIC has been evident since the facility's establishment. 
At the end of the initial 18 month evaluation period most residents (78%) and business 
operators (63%) interviewed during the evaluation supported the MSIC (MSIC Evaluation 
Committee, 2003). This high level of public support continued through to the first five years 
of the operation of the service, with over 90% of resident and business operator 
respondents noting positive effects of the facility (Salmon, Thein, Kimber, Kaldor, & Maher, 
2007). 
 

Reduction in opioid overdoses, in particular fatal overdoses  

Supervised injecting facilities offer the prospect of prompt and appropriate intervention in 
the case of overdose, by providing access to professional support and/or naloxone (van 
Beek, Kimber, Dakin, & Gilmour, 2004). Derived largely from studies of the facilities in 
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Vancouver SIF and Sydney MSIC, published ecological evidence suggests that supervised 
injecting facilities reduce both fatal and non-fatal opioid overdose. 

The establishment and implementation of the Sydney MSIC resulted in a large decline in 
non-fatal opioid overdoses attended by ambulance (defined as ambulance attendances 
where naloxone was administered), that was statistically significantly larger than any similar 
effects seen across Sydney and New South Wales more broadly (Salmon, van Beek, Amin, 
Kaldor, & Maher, 2010). Similarly, overdose death rates within 500 metres of the Vancouver 
SIF declined following the implementation of the facility, which was statistically significantly 
greater than any decline seen in other areas of Vancouver (Marshall, Milloy, Wood, 
Montaner, & Kerr, 2011). Indeed, estimates of the number of fatal opioid overdoses averted 
through both the Sydney (estimated between 4-9, MSIC Evaluation Committee, 2003) and 
Vancouver facilities (estimated between 1.9-11.7 per annum, Milloy, Kerr, Tyndall, 
Montaner, & Wood, 2008) were a significant contributor to the overall cost-effectiveness 
demonstrated in economic analyses of the two facilities. Importantly, it is widely known that 
there has been no recorded overdose fatality in any of the injecting facilities operating 
across the world and supervised injecting facilities are listed as an evidence-informed 
intervention in the National Drug Strategy (Intergovernmental Committee on Drugs, 2015). 

 

SIF implementation requires regulatory change to allow the legal consumption of illegal 
drugs. The Sydney Medically Supervised Injecting centre (MSIC) is covered by Part 2A of the 
NSW Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 that was enacted specifically to create the 
operating conditions of the service. These conditions include specifications of the basic 
operational environment of the MSIC (including the requirements for supervision and 
medical training of staff) as well as allowing illicit drug possession and consumption, and 
allowing police to exercise discretion around charging people with drug offences if the 
person is travelling to or from the MSIC.  Equivalent legislative provision for Vancouver’s 
Insite SIF was required at a Federal level in Canada, but such provision is not required under 
Australian law. Establishment of any SIF in Melbourne requires only amendment of the 
Victorian Drugs, Poisons and Controlled Substances Act 1981, with the Part 2 A of the NSW 
Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 serving as an appropriate model. We note that this 
type of change has been mooted in the Drugs, Poisons and Controlled Substances 
Amendment (Pilot Medically Supervised Injecting Centre) Bill 2017.  

 

In light of the evidence we have reviewed supporting the effectiveness of safe injecting 
facilities in both reducing overdoses and improving public health and public amenity, we 
strongly recommend the establishment of a safe injecting facility in the City of Yarra. We 
recognise that implementation of any such facility would need to be supported by rigorous 
scientific evaluation to determine effectiveness in the Victorian context.  
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